DEPARTMENT OF THE ARMY
U.S. ARMY CORPS OF ENGINEERS
441 G STREET, NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20314-1000

CECW-P APR 25 2019

MEMORANDUM FOR SEE DISTRIBUTION

SUBJECT: Revised Implementation Guidance for Section 1157 of the Water
Resources Development Act (WRDA) of 2018, U.S. Army Corps of Engineers
Continuing Authorities Program

1. The Assistant Secretary of the Army, Civil Works approved on 19 April 2019 Section
1157 of WRDA 2018. The attached implementation guidance is posted for internal and
external use on the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers official WRDA website:
http://www.usace.army.mil/Missions/Civil-Works/Project-Planning/Legislative-Links/.

2. Please ensure wide dissemination of this guidance. Questions regarding this
implementation guidance should be directed to the Headquarters POC, Joseph Mose,
Program Manager, Continuing Authorities Program, Programs and Integration Division,
at (202) 761-4825 or joseph.h.mose@usace.army.mil.

JAgES C. DALTON, P.E.

Director of Civil Works

DISTRIBUTION:

COMMANDERS, REGIONAL BUSINESS AND PROGRAMS DIRECTORS
GREAT LAKES AND OHIO RIVER DIVISION, CELRD

MISSISSIPPI VALLEY DIVISION, CEMVD

NORTH ATLANTIC DIVISION, CENAD

NORTHWESTERN DIVISION, CENWD

PACIFIC OCEAN DIVISION, CEPOD

SOUTH ATLANTIC DIVISION, CESAD

SOUTH PACIFIC DIVISION, CESPD

SOUTHWESTERN DIVISION, CESWD












Water Resources Development Act of 2018, Section 1157. Corps of Engineers
Continuing Authorities Program

(a) STORM AND HURRICANE RESTORATION AND IMPACT MINIMIZATION
PROGRAM. Section 3(c)(1) of the Act of August 13, 1946 (33 U.S.C. 426g(c)(1)) is
amended by striking “$30,000,000” and inserting “$37,500,000.”

(b) SMALL RIVER AND HARBOR IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS. Section
107(a) of the River and Harbor Act of 1960 (33 U.S.C. 577(a)) is amended by striking
“$50,000,000” and inserting “$62,500,000.”

(c) SHORE DAMAGE PREVENTION OR MITIGATION. Section 111(c) of the River
and Harbor Act of 1968 (33 U.S.C. 426i(c)) is amended by striking “$10,000,000” and
inserting “$12,500,000.”

(d) REGIONAL SEDIMENT MANAGEMENT. Section 204(g) of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1992 (33 U.S.C. 2326(g)) is amended in the first sentence by
striking “$50,000,000” and inserting “$62,500,000.”

(e) SMALL FLOOD CONTROL PROJECTS. Section 205 of the Flood Control Act of
1948 (33 U.S.C. 701s) is amended in the first sentence by striking “$55,000,000” and
inserting “$68,750,000

(f) AQUATIC ECOSYSTEM RESTORATION. Section 206(f) of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1996 (as redesignated by section 1149) is amended by striking
“$50,000,000” and inserting “$62,500,000.”

(g) PROJECT MODIFICATIONS FOR IMPROVEMENT OF ENVIRONMENT. Section
1135(h) of the Water Resources Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2309a(h)) is
amended by striking “$40,000,000” and inserting “$50,000,000.”

(h) EMERGENCY STREAMBANK AND SHORELINE PROTECTION. Section 14 of
the Flood Control Act of 1946 (33 U.S.C. 701r) is amended by striking “$20,000,000”
and inserting “$25,000,000.”

(i) TRIBAL PARTNERSHIP PROGRAM. Section 203(b)(4) of the Water Resources
Development Act of 2000 (33 U.S.C. 2269) is amended to read as follows:

(4) DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION.

(A) IN GENERAL. The Secretary may carry out the design and construction of a water
resources development project, or separable element of a project, described in
paragraph (1) that the Secretary determines is feasible if the Federal share of the cost
of the project or separable element is not more than $12,500,000.

Enclosure






